
2022-644 Furniture, Fixtures, and Equipment_Gardner Elementary School
Bid Opening - January 19th, 2022 at 12:00 PM

WB Mason Co., Inc. Robert H. Lord Company, Inc. Creative Office Pavilion LLC Lakeshore Learning Materials
RDC Holdings LLC dba School 

Furnishings

Subcategory A1 $155,969.00 $158,668.35 $169,866.00 No Bid $144,134.06

Subcategory A2 $21,850.00 $12,398.80 $20,688.00 $6,415.84 $12,507.60

Subcategory B1 $18,865.00 $17,427.76 $37,801.00 $8,312.17 $25,098.04

Subcategory C1 $4,395.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,955.22

Subcategory C2 $40,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23,210.32

Subcategory C3 $6,023.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,247.54

Subcategory D2 $42,737.00 No Bid No Bid $34,822.92 $46,304.43

Subcategory D3 $59,330.00 $42,661.06 No Bid $26,390.04 $50,449.64

Subcategory D1 $68,400.00 $26,174.40 No Bid $55,232.20 $97,116.62

Subcategory E1 $29,981.00 No Bid No Bid $1,244.33 $14,578.80

Subcategory E2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $774.86

Subcategory E3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14,586.53

Subcategory E4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,158.26

Subcategory E5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $79,368.76

5% Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Certificates Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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